

Minutes of the meeting of Financial Committee for Medical Equipment Tender No. BMSICL/2018-19/ME-106, for Installation, Operation and Maintenance of CT Scan Machines in PPP mode for thirty six (36) District Hospitals of Bihar held on 07th May 2019 at Conference hall of BMSICL.

1. Attendance :- As per attendance register.
2. Tender for Installation, Operation and Maintenance of CT Scan Machines in PPP mode for thirty six (36) district hospitals of Bihar was invited vide tender no. BMSICL/2018-19/ME-106 through publication of notice inviting Tender (Advertisement ID 19644 generated in light of BMSICL Letter no. 3834 dated 17.11.2018). This tender notice was also uploaded and published on the official website of BMSICL i.e. www.bmsicl.gov.in. and www.eproc.bihar.gov.in.
3. In the online opening of technical bids on 18.01.2019 for tender no. BMSICL/2018-19/ME-106, multiple bids were received for only 22 nos. of District Hospitals out of a total of thirty six nos. of district hospitals for which tender was invited.
4. The details of district hospitals wise successfully submitted bids are as follows:-

Sl. No.	Name of District Hospitals	Name of Bidders	No. of Bids Received
1	District Hospital Araria	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	04
		ii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
2	District Hospital Arwal	No bid	00
3	District Hospital Aurangabad	i. M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	05
		ii. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
		v. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
4	District Hospital Banka	No bid	00
5	District Hospital Begusarai	i. M/s Spandan Diagnostic centre Pvt. Ltd.	03

		ii. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
6	District Hospital Bhagalpur	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
7	District Hospital Bhojpur	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	04
		ii. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic centre Pvt. Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
8	District Hospital Buxar	No bid	00
9	District Hospital Champaran East	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic centre Pvt. Ltd.	
10	District Hospital Champaran West	i. M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
11	District Hospital Gaya	i. M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd.	02
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
12	District Hospital Gopalganj	No bid	00
13	District Hospital Jamui	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	01

14	District Hospital Jehanabad	No bid	00
15	District Hospital Kaimur	No bid	00
16	District Hospital Katihar	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	02
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
17	District Hospital Khagaria	No bid	00
18	District Hospital Kishanganj	i. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
19	District Hospital Lakhisarai	No bid	00
20	District Hospital Madhepura	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	02
		ii. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
21	District Hospital Madhubani	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
22	District Hospital Munger	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
23	District Hospital Muzaffarpur	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	05
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		v. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
24	District Hospital Nalanda	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	06

		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		v. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
		vi. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
25	District Hospital Nawada	No bid	00
26	District Hospital Purnia	i. M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	06
		ii. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		v. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
		vi. M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	
27	District Hospital Rohtas	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
28	District Hospital Saharsa	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	02
		ii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
29	District Hospital Samastipur	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
30	District Hospital Saran	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	04

		ii. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Health Map Diagnostics Pvt. Ltd.	
31	District Hospital Seikhpura	No bid	00
32	District Hospital Sheohar	No bid	00
33	District Hospital Sitamarhi	i. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	03
		ii. M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
34	District Hospital Siwan	No bid	00
35	District Hospital Supaul	No bid	00
36	District Hospital Vaishali	i. M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	06
		ii. M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	
		iii. M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	
		iv. M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	
		v. M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	
		vi. M/s Health Map Diagnostics Pvt. Ltd.	

5. The district hospital wise technical evaluation sheets pertaining to the technical bids for tender no- BMSICL/2018-19/ME-106, were uploaded on the website of BMSICL vide letter no- BMSIC/45025/113-2018/6413 dated:-29.03.2019 to invite claims/objections, as per the decision taken in the meeting of this TEC dated 15/03/2019.
6. The claims/objections received from the bidders were examined by the TEC in the meeting held on 26/04/2019. The clarification/objections received in the light of the evaluation sheets uploaded on the website of BMSICL were further examined and a comparative chart was prepared vis a-vis the preliminary evaluation sheets and it was, unanimously decided to recommend for opening of financial bids of the CT Scan Machine for which more than one bidder had technically qualified.

7. The details of technically qualified bidders are as follows:-

Sl. No.	Name of Equipment	Name of Bidders	Status	Remarks
1	CT Scan	ADD ANNEX HEALTHCARE PVT. LTD.	Qualified	Recommended for Financial Bids Opening of all qualified Bidders
		Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	Qualified	
		Healthmap Diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	Qualified	
		Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	Qualified	
		Medionn Diagnostics Limited.	Qualified	
		SPANDAN Diagnostics & Research Centre Pvt. Limited	Qualified	
		M/S Capital Business System Pvt. Ltd.	Qualified	

8. As per the recommendation dated: 26.04.2019 of Technical Evaluation Committee, the financial committee meeting for opening of financial bids of all the qualified bidders was held today i.e. on 07.05.2019 at 12:30 PM as per schedule.

9. After opening of the financial bids (Annexure-A), a comparative chart has been prepared which is follows:-

Sl. No.	Name of District Hospitals	Name of Bidders	Flat Discount (in Percentage) on CGHS Rates (Patna) for the Tests required as per NIT	Ranking on flat discount Highest Percentage offered
1	District Hospital Araria	M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	20	H-1
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-3

		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	2	H-4
2	District Hospital Aurangabad	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27	H-1
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	22	H-2
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16	H-3
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	10	H-4
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	9.51	H-5
3	District Hospital Begusarai	M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	18	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic centre Pvt. Ltd.	17	H-2
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	6.6	H-3
4	District Hospital Bhagalpur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	22	H-1
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	16	H-2
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-3
5	District Hospital Bhojpur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	17	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic centre Pvt. Ltd.	16	H-2
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	12.70	H-3
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	6	H-4
6	District Hospital Champaran East	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic centre Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2

		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-3
7	District Hospital Champaran West	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27	H-1
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	3	H-3
8	District Hospital Gaya	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd.	27	H-1
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-2
9	District Hospital Katihar	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-1
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-2
10	District Hospital Kishanganj	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16	H-1
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-2
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	11	H-3
11	District Hospital Madhepura	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	17	H-1
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	9.2	H-2
12	District Hospital Madhubani	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	2	H-3
13	District Hospital Munger	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-1
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	15	H-2
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	6.2	H-3
14	District Hospital Muzaffarpur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	33	H-1

		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	18	H-2
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	14	H-3
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-4
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	7	H-5
15	District Hospital Nalanda	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	22	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	17	H-2
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	13	H-3
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-4
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	11.2	H-5
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	6	H-6
16	District Hospital Purnia	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27	H-1
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	22	H-2
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	17	H-3
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16	H-4
		M/s Health Map diagnostic Pvt. Ltd.	13.6	H-5
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	8	H-6
17	District Hospital Rohtas	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-3
18	District Hospital Saharsa	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt.	17	H-1

		Ltd.		
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2
19	District Hospital Samastipur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-1
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	12	H-2
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-3
20	District Hospital Saran	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	18	H-1
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16	H-2
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	5	H-3
		M/s Health Map Diagnostics Pvt. Ltd.	2.2	H-4
21	District Hospital Sitamarhi	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16	H-1
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15	H-2
		M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	11.16	H-3
22	District Hospital Vaishali	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27	H-1
		M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	25	H-2
		M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	19	H-3
		M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	18	H-4
		M/s Health Map Diagnostics Pvt. Ltd.	15.8	H-5
		M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	10	H-6

10. As evident from the above table, it is clear that M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd. and M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd. have quoted same percentage discount (15%) for district Hospitals East Champaran, Rohtas & Madhubani respectively and M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd. & M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd. have quoted same percentage discount (15%) for district hospital of Munger.

In such cases as above, the relevant condition laid in the Tender Document vide Point No-2 of Corrigendum-III is quoted here in below:-

“IN case two or more bidders quote the same discount CGHS rates for any district, preference (priority in selection) shall be given to that bidder, who has quoted for higher numbers of districts “.

11. The bidder wise details of total no of bids submitted for different district hospitals is given herein belows:-

Sl.No.	Name of Bidder	Total number of bids submitted for different district hospitals
1	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	20
2	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	15
3	M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	10
4	M/s Capital Business Systems Pvt. Ltd.	10
5	M/s Eskag Sanjeevani Pvt. Ltd.	10
6	M/s Health Map Diagnostics Pvt. Ltd.	09
7	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	05

As evident from the above table, it is clear that M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd. has quoted for the maximum number of district hospitals. Hence as per the condition outlined in the Tender Document the said firm (M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.) is declared H-1 for the above said four district hospitals viz. (I) East Champaran (II) Rohtas (III) Madhubani (IV) Munger.

12. District hospital wise final list of successful bidders (H-1) with the respective discount on CGHS rates is given herein below:-

Sl. No.	Name of the District Hospital	Name of the successful Bidder	Flat Discount (in Percentage) on CGHS Rates for the Tests required as per NIT
1	District Hospital Araria	M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	20 %
2	District Hospital Aurangabad	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27 %
3	District Hospital Begusarai	M/s Medionn Diagnostics Ltd.	18 %
4	District Hospital Bhagalpur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	22 %
5	District Hospital Bhojpur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	17 %
6	District Hospital Champaran East	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15 %
7	District Hospital Champaran West	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27 %
8	District Hospital Gaya	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd.	27 %
9	District Hospital Katihar	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15 %
10	District Hospital Kishanganj	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16 %
11	District Hospital Madhepura	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	17 %
12	District Hospital Madhubani	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15 %
13	District Hospital Munger	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15 %
14	District Hospital Muzaffarpur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	33 %
15	District Hospital Nalanda	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	22 %
16	District Hospital Purnia	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27 %
17	District Hospital Rohtas	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15 %
18	District Hospital Saharsa	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	17 %
19	District Hospital Samastipur	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	15 %

20	District Hospital Saran	M/s Kalpana Nursing Home Pvt. Ltd.	18 %
21	District Hospital Sitamarhi	M/s Spandan Diagnostic Centre Pvt. Ltd.	16 %
22	District Hospital Vaishali	M/s Add Annex Health Care Pvt. Ltd	27 %

13. Accordingly, it is decided to issue Letter of Intent (LOI) to the above mentioned H-1 bidders for Installation, Operation and Maintenance of CT Scan Machines in PPP mode in the respective district hospitals.

The meeting concluded with a vote of thanks.

Sd/-
(Principal)
PMCH, Patna

Sd/-
(Sh. Ramendra Kumar)
GM (Finance)
BMSICL

Sd/-
(Sh. Sunil Kumar Singh)
GM (Procurement)
BMSICL.

Sd/-
(Sh. Rajani Kant)
CGM (Supply Chain)
BMSICL

Sd/-
(Sh. Khalid Arshad)
A.O. SHSB

Sd/-
(Dr. R D Ranjan)
Director in Chief,
Health Department,
Govt. of Bihar

Sd/-
(Assistant I.F.A)
Health Deptt.,G.O.B

Sd/-
(Sh. Sanjaya Kr. Singh)
Managing Director
BMSICL